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On the National Day of France Alexandra
Ungureanu & Crush and CRBL will give a
show at Mioveni
Dacia celebrates the National Day of France this year as well, as it has already accustomed its fans
and employers, on Saturday 12 July in Mioveni. The celebration is twice more important this year
because the plants at Colibasi also celebrate 15 years since the Romanian brand was taken over by
the French car manufacturer and 10 years since the market launch of the success model Dacia Logan.

Although this concert has become a tradition for Mioveni, this year comes with premieres and
novelties. One of the premieres is the involvement of local talents in the programme. The members of
the Zen musical group will be present on the scene of the Trade Union Cultural House in Mioveni at
18.30; they are a group of teenage musicians in Mioveni trained at the Cultural House by their
teacher Hamar Levente within the guitar club. They will give a recital including covers of well-known
pop and rock songs. 

The Zen group recital will be followed by shows given by children in the theatre group “Clubul
veseliei” (“Club of joy”), coordinated by professor Ionut Vlad, who is also a teacher in the Cultural
Centre Mioveni. Starting at 19.30 children are invited on the platform in front of the Trade Union
Cultural House for a special programme dedicated to them. Actors dressed up in costumes inspired
from fairy tale personages will paint children’s faces, will make balloon figurines for them and will
engage them in various games and contests. The programme dedicated to the youngest Dacia fans
will end at 20.30.

Around 21.00 Alexandra Ungureanu and Crush will be present on the scene, while in the second part
of the concert the public will be able to sing and dance with CRBL.

The concert is organised with support from the Mioveni Town Hall, the Mioveni Local Council and the
Cultural Centre in Mioveni and the media partners are Radio 21, Sapte Seri and Absolut TV. The
tradition of annual concerts organised by Automobile Dacia at Mioveni on the occasion of the National
Day of France was initiated in 2006 with a concert given by Ştefan Bănică Jr. and continued with
Holograf (2007), Voltaj (2008), Aurelian Temişan, Daniel Iordachioaie and the group O-la-la (2009),
Direcţia 5 (2010), Bere gratis and Fly Project (2011), Hara and Andreea Bălan (2012), Smiley (2013).


